
Total No. of Bidders:           
Anne Arundel County, Maryland

Tabulation of Bids:  6
IFB NO.: 12-005

TITLE: CARS, VANS, AND LIGHT TRUCKS
OPENING DATE: JANUARY 24, 2012
BID BOND REQUIREMENT: NO
BUYER:   STEPHEN PORTS

Brief Description
Unit 
Price QTY Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price

Item #1: 3.5 Mid-Size Automobile, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.5.9 Optional Hybrid Power Train, per Specifications (cost to be the total 
price of 3.5 vehicle with the Hybrid power train).  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.5 (2012) Mid-Size Automobile, per Specificiations.  Model year 2012 EA 1 No Bid No Bid 17,236.00 17,236.00 19,500.00 19,500.00 19,380.00 19,380.00

3.5.9 (2012) Optional Hybrid Power Train, per Specifications (cost to be the 
total price of 3.5 vehicle with the Hybrid power train).  Model year 2012 No Bid No Bid 26,081.00 26,800.00 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle Make & Model Bid No Bid No Bid 2012 Ford Fusion SE
Item #2: 3.6 Mid-Size Police Package Automobile, per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 EA 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.6.10.1 Optional console mount platform, per Specifications.  Model year 
2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.6.10.2 Optional hole in center of roof, with wiring harness, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.6.10.3 Optional left-hand spot-lamp, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.6.10.4 Optional two-tone paint, per Specifiations.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.6 (2012) Mid-Size Police Package Automobile, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 EA 3 23,702.00 71,106.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 23,188.00 69,564.00
3.6.10.1 (2012) Optional console mount platform, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 174.00
3.6.10.2 (2012) Optional hole in center of roof, with wiring harness, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 178.50
3.6.10.3 (2012) Optional left-hand spot-lamp, per Specifications.  Model year
2012 187.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 339.15

3.6.10.4 (2012)Optional two-tone paint, per Specifiations.  Model year 2012 1,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 999.00
Vehicle Make & Model Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item #3: 3.7 Full size police interceptor package, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2011 EA 9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.1 Optional two-tone exterior paint, per Specifications.  Model year 
2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.2 Optional street appearance pacakage, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.7.10.3 Optional cloth bench seats, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2012 Ford Fusion SE 2012 Dodge Avenger JSDH41

2012 Chevrolet Impala 9C3 1WS19

Criswell Chevrolet, Inc.Winner Ford Kip Killmon's Tysons Ford Lindsay Ford, LLC

2013 Ford Interceptor
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3.7.10.4 Optional base police package, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.5 Optional flashing rear deck LED lights, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.6 Optional hole in center of roof with wiring harness, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.7.10.7 Optional left-hand spot-lamp, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.8 Optional cruise control, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.9 Optional white/red incadescent LED dome light, per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.10 Optional complete marked automobile, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.11 Optional complete un-marked automobile, per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.12 Optional complete "turn-key" marked automobile, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7 (2012) Full size police interceptor package, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 EA 9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 26,948.00 242,532.00
3.7.10.1 (2012) Optional two-tone exterior paint, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 999.00
3.7.10.2 (2012) Optional street appearance pacakage, per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,779.45
3.7.10.3 (2012) Optional cloth bench seats, per Specifications.  Model year 
2012 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
3.7.10.4 (2012) Optional base police package, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,097.62
3.7.10.5 (2012) Optional flashing rear deck LED lights, per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 456.00
3.7.10.6 (2012) Optional hole in center of roof with wiring harness, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 153.00
3.7.10.7 (2012) Optional left-hand spot-lamp, per Specifications.  Model year
2012 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 290.00

3.7.10.8 (2012) Optional cruise control, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid standard
3.7.10.9 (2012) Optional white/red incadescent LED dome light, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 102.00



Total No. of Bidders:           
Anne Arundel County, Maryland

Tabulation of Bids:  6
IFB NO.: 12-005

TITLE: CARS, VANS, AND LIGHT TRUCKS
OPENING DATE: JANUARY 24, 2012
BID BOND REQUIREMENT: NO
BUYER:   STEPHEN PORTS

Brief Description
Unit 
Price QTY Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price

Criswell Chevrolet, Inc.Winner Ford Kip Killmon's Tysons Ford Lindsay Ford, LLC

3.7.10.10 (2012) Optional complete marked automobile, per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,272.75
3.7.10.11 (2012) Optional complete un-marked automobile, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,653.10
3.7.10.12 (2012) Optional complete "turn-key" marked automobile, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5,415.77

Vehicle Make & Model Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item #4 3.8 Mini 4x4, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Door: Utilized as a Reference 
Only: Ford Escape, Ford Escape Hybrid, and Jeep Liberty, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011. EA 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.8.10.1 Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe with mounting 
base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  Model year 
2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.8.10.2 Optional AM/FM Radio, CD player, per Specifications.  Model year 
2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.8.10.3 Optional Cruise Control, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.8.10.4 Optional V-6, Gasoline Engine, per Specifications.  Model year 
2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.8.10.5 Optional Two (2)-Wheel Drive, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.8.11 Optional Hybrid Power Train (cost to be the total price of spec 3.8 
vehicle with the Hybrid power train), per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.8 (2012) Mini 4x4, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Door: Utilized as a Reference 
Only: Ford Escape, Ford Escape Hybrid, and Jeep Liberty, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 EA 2 25,279.00 50,558.00 23,769.00 47,538.00 24,300.00 48,600.00 19,516.00 39,032.00
3.8.10.1 (2012) Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe with 
mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 350.00 495.00 259.00 259.00
3.8.10.2 (2012) Optional AM/FM Radio, CD player, per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 standard standard N/C standard
3.8.10.3 (2012) Optional Cruise Control, per Specifications.  Model year 
2012 standard standard N/C standard
3.8.10.4 (2012) Optional V-6, Gasoline Engine, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 N/A N/A No Bid standard

2012 Cheverolet Caprise PPV 1EW15
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3.8.10.5 (2012) Optional Two (2)-Wheel Drive, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 -4,200.00 22,229.00 20,300.00 -1,500.00

3.8.11 (2012) Optional Hybrid Power Train (cost to be the total price of spec 
3.8 vehicle with the Hybrid power train), per Specifications.  Model year 2012 N/A N/A No Bid N/A

Vehicle Make & Model Bid
Item #5 3.9 Mid-Size 4x4, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Door, Utilized as a 
Reference Only: Ford Explorer, and Chevrolet Trailblazer, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.9.10 Optional V-8, Gasoline Engine (cost of engine upgrade only), per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.9.11 Optional Hybrid Power Train (cost to be the total price of 3.2 vehicle 
with the Hybrid power train), per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.9 (2012) Mid-Size 4x4, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Door, Utilized as a 
Reference Only: Ford Explorer, and Chevrolet Trailblazer, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 EA 1 25,898.00 25,898.00 25,220.00 26,000.00 26,000.00 28,273.00 28,273.00
3.9.10 (2012) Optional V-8, Gasoline Engine (cost of engine upgrade only), 
per Specifications.  Model year 2012 N/A N/A No Bid 4,300.00

3.9.11 (2012) Optional Hybrid Power Train (cost to be the total price of 3.2 
vehicle with the Hybrid power train), per Specifications.  Model year 2012 N/A N/A No Bid N/A

Vehicle Make & Model Bid
Item #6 3.10 Full-Size 4x4, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Door.  Utilized as a 
Reference Only: Ford Expedition, and Chevrolet Tahoe, per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.10.10.1 Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe with 
mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.10.10.2 Optional deduction for deleting floor console, per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.10.10.3 Optional deduction for deleting 3rd row seating, per Specifications.
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.10.10.4 Optional Class III hitch, tow package, with 7-pin plug & wiring 
harness, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2012 Jeep Liberty KKJL74

2013 Ford Explorer 2012 Dodge Durango WDEL75

2013 Ford Escape 2013 Ford Escape2013 Ford Escape SE

2013 Ford Explorer2013 Ford Explorer
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3.10 (2012) Full-Size 4x4, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Door.  Utilized as a 
Reference Only: Ford Expedition, and Chevrolet Tahoe, per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 EA 1 30,969.00 30,969.00 30,294.00 30,294.00 31,100.00 31,100.00 33,234.00 33,234.00
3.10.10.1 (2012) Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe with 
mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 350.00 595.00 259.00 259.00
3.10.10.2 (2012) Optional deduction for deleting floor console, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 -1,500.00 N/A -1,700.00 -500.00
3.10.10.3 (2012) Optional deduction for deleting 3rd row seating, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 -725.00 N/A -744.00 -300.00
3.10.10.4 (2012) Optional Class III hitch, tow package, with 7-pin plug & 
wiring harness, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 340.00 365.00 336.00 200.00

Vehicle Make & Model Bid
Item #7: 3.11 Mini Pickup Truck, 1/2-Ton, 2WD, Extended Cab, with 6-ft. 
Cargo Box: Utilized as a Reference Only: Chevrolet Colorado, Ford Ranger, 
per Specifications.  Model year 2011 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.11.10.1 Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Storbe light with 
mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.11.10.2 Optional Four (4)-Wheel Drive, per Specifciations.  Model year 
2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.11 (2012) Mini Pickup Truck, 1/2-Ton, 2WD, Extended Cab, with 6-ft. 
Cargo Box: Utilized as a Reference Only: Chevrolet Colorado, Ford Ranger, 
per Specifications.  Model year 2012 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 16,576.00 16,576.00
3.11.10.1 (2012) Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Storbe light 
with mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 259.00
3.11.10.2 (2012) Optional Four (4)-Wheel Drive, per Specifciations.  Model 
year 2012 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,100.00

Vehicle Make & Model Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2012 Chevrolet Colorado CS15653
Item #8 3.12 Pickup Truck, 1/2-Ton, 2WD, Full Size, Standard Cab, with 8-
ft. Bed: Utilized as a Reference Only: Chevrolet Silverado 1500, Ford F150, 
per Specifications.  Model year 2011 EA 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.12.10.1 Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe light with 
mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2012 Chevrolet Tahoe CK107062012 Ford Expedition2012 Ford Expedition2012 Ford Expedition 
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3.12.10.2 Optional extended cab, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.12.10.3 Optional Four (4)-Wheel Drive, per Specifications.  Model year 
2011. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.12.10.4 Optional Class III hitch, tow package, with 7-pin plug & wiring 
harness, per Specifications.  Model year 2011. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.12.10.5 Optional trialer hitch receiver - 9,900 lb. Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.12.10.6 Optional hydraulic lift gate, 1,200 - 1,500 lbs.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.12.10.7 Optional rear seat (for extended cab option only), per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.12 (2012) Pickup Truck, 1/2-Ton, 2WD, Full Size, Standard Cab, with 8-ft. 
Bed: Utilized as a Reference Only: Chevrolet Silverado 1500, Ford F150, 
per Specifications.  Model year 2012 EA 2 15,578.00 31,156.00 15,097.00 30,194.00 15,700.00 31,400.00 16,933.00 33,866.00
3.12.10.1 (2012) Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe light 
with mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 350.00 595.00 259.00 259.00
3.12.10.2 (2012) Optional extended cab, per Specifications.  Model year 
2012 2,546.00 17,181.00 2,500.00 5,500.00
3.12.10.3 (2012)  Optional Four (4)-Wheel Drive, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012. 3,200.00 18,158.00 3,100.00 2,900.00
3.12.10.4 (2012) Optional Class III hitch, tow package, with 7-pin plug & 
wiring harness, per Specifications.  Model year 2012. 3,450.00 345.00 311.00 1,300.00

3.12.10.5 (2012) Optional trialer hitch receiver - 9,900 lb. Model year 2012 3,450.00 N/C included with hitch pkg 1,300.00
3.12.10.6 (2012) Optional hydraulic lift gate, 1,200 - 1,500 lbs.  Model year 
2012 2,500.00 2,580.00 2,440.00 1,945.00
3.12.10.7 (2012) Optional rear seat (for extended cab option only), per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 standard with 10.2 standard N/C standard

Vehicle Make & Model Bid
Item #9 3.13 pickup Truck, 3/4 Ton, 2WD, Full Size, Standard Cab, 8-ft. 
Bed.  Utilized as a Reference Only: Ford F250 SD, and Chevrolet Silverado 
2500 HD, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.13.10.1 Optional Warn Target Tech, Model 901, Amber Strobe Light, with 
in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2012 Ford F-150 2012 Ford F-150 2012 Chevrolet CC109032012 Ford F-150
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3.13.10.2 Optional Hydraulic lift gate, 1,200 to 1,500 lbs, per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.13.10.3 Optional Four (4)-Wheel Drive, with automatic locking hubs, and 
shift on the fly Transfer case, per Specifciations.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.13.10.4 Otional Power angle snowplow with lights, deflector, and 
removable light frame and power unit (standard width for 4x4 configuration), 
per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.13.10.5 Optional Towing Command System, with integrated Tow 
Command Trailer Brake Controller, per Specifications. Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.13.10.6 Optional Off Road Package - fel tank and transfer case skid 
plates, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.13.10.7 Optional Complete Pickup Truck, 1-Ton, Full Size, Standard Cab, 
8-ft. Bed, with the following options, 4-Wheel Drive, Towing command 
System with integrated Tow Command Trailer Brake Contoller, Class 4 tow 
package, with trailer wiring 7-/4 pin connector, 9,000-lb Trailer Hitch 
Receiver or greater, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.13 (2012)  pickup Truck, 3/4 Ton, 2WD, Full Size, Standard Cab, 8-ft. Bed. 
Utilized as a Reference Only: Ford F250 SD, and Chevrolet Silverado 2500 
HD, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 EA 1 19,348.00 19,348.00 18,490.00 18,490.00 19,500.00 19,500.00 19,208.00 19,208.00
3.13.10.1 (2012) Optional Warn Target Tech, Model 901, Amber Strobe 
Light, with in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 350.00 595.00 259.00 259.00
3.13.10.2 (2012) Optional Hydraulic lift gate, 1,200 to 1,500 lbs, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 2,500.00 2,580.00 2,440.00 1,945.00
3.13.10.3 (2012) Optional Four (4)-Wheel Drive, with automatic locking 
hubs, and shift on the fly Transfer case, per Specifciations.  Model year 
2012 2,450.00 20,826.00 2,300.00 2,700.00
3.13.10.4 (2012) Otional Power angle snowplow with lights, deflector, and 
removable light frame and power unit (standard width for 4x4 configuration), 
per Specifications.  Model year 2012 4,295.00 4,995.00 4,755.00 4,835.00

3.13.10.5 (2012) Optional Towing Command System, with integrated Tow 
Command Trailer Brake Controller, per Specifications. Model year 2012 191.00 295.00 191.00 455.00
3.13.10.6 (2012) Optional Off Road Package - fel tank and transfer case 
skid plates, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 85.00 795.00 83.00 included
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3.13.10.7 (2012) Optional Complete Pickup Truck, 1-Ton, Full Size, 
Standard Cab, 8-ft. Bed, with the following options, 4-Wheel Drive, Towing 
command System with integrated Tow Command Trailer Brake Contoller, 
Class 4 tow package, with trailer wiring 7-/4 pin connector, 9,000-lb Trailer 
Hitch Receiver or greater, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 21,989.00 25,997.00 26,800.00 22,363.00

Vehicle Make & Model Bid
Item #10 3.14 Cargo Van, 3/4 Ton, Rear Wheel Drive.  Utilized as a 
Reference Only: Chevrolet Express Cargo 2500, Ford Super Duty E 250, 
per Specifications.  Model year 2011 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.1 Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe light with 
mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.2 Optional Swing out hinged type side door with pop out glass, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.3 Optional Extended van body, (231" in overall length or greater), 
per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.14.10.4 Optional AM/FM CD Player, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.5 Optional Class III Hitch, Tow Package, with 7-pin Plug and wiring 
harness, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.14.10.6 Optional Deduction for Removing the Approved Safety Bulkheads 
behind the drive and passenger seats, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.7 Optional Heavy Duty High Amperage Alternator, per Specifiations. 
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.8 Optional right sliding cargo door with No Glass Window, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.9 Optional rear side hinged panel cargo doors with No Glass Windo, 
per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.10 Optional Deduction for removing interior paneling or molding in 
the vans cargo area to facilitate shelving.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.14.10.11 Optional rear heat and A/C, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.12 Optional side and rear door glass, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2012 Chevrolet CC209032012 Ford F-250 2012 Ford F-2502012 Ford F-250
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Criswell Chevrolet, Inc.Winner Ford Kip Killmon's Tysons Ford Lindsay Ford, LLC

3.14 (2012) Cargo Van, 3/4 Ton, Rear Wheel Drive.  Utilized as a Reference 
Only: Chevrolet Express Cargo 2500, Ford Super Duty E 250, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 EA 1 19,585.00 19,585.00 18,017.00 18,017.00 19,000.00 19,000.00 21,371.00 21,371.00
3.14.10.1 (2012) Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe light 
with mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 350.00 595.00 259.00 259.00
3.14.10.2 (2012) Optional Swing out hinged type side door with pop out 
glass, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 -100.00 189.00 -120.00 -150.00
3.14.10.3 (2012) Optional Extended van body, (231" in overall length or 
greater), per Specifications.  Model year 2012 1,200.00 18,996.00 1,000.00 1,750.00
3.14.10.4 (2012) Optional AM/FM CD Player, per Specifications.  Model year
2012 245.00 295.00 245.00 200.00
3.14.10.5 (2012) Optional Class III Hitch, Tow Package, with 7-pin Plug and 
wiring harness, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 328.00 465.00 328.00 250.00
3.14.10.6 (2012) Optional Deduction for Removing the Approved Safety 
Bulkheads behind the drive and passenger seats, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 -375.00 N/C 0.00 -430.00
3.14.10.7 (2012) Optional Heavy Duty High Amperage Alternator, per 
Specifiations.  Model year 2012 66.00 standard 42.00 75.00
3.14.10.8 (2012) Optional right sliding cargo door with No Glass Window, 
per Specifications.  Model year 2012 0.00 -50.00 -100.00 -50.00
3.14.10.9 (2012) Optional rear side hinged panel cargo doors with No Glass 
Windo, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 -100.00 -100.00 -268.00 -100.00
3.14.10.10 (2012) Optional Deduction for removing interior paneling or 
molding in the vans cargo area to facilitate shelving.  Model year 2012 0.00 N/C 0.00 0.00
3.14.10.11 (2012) Optional rear heat and A/C, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 685.00 895.00 685.00 750.00
3.14.10.12 (2012) Optional side and rear door glass, per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 0.00 284.00 154.00 130.00

Vehicle Make & Model Bid
Item #11 3.15 Passenger Van, 1-Ton, Fifteen (15)-Person Seating Capacity, 
Rear Wheel Drive, Extended Van, 3-Door.  Utilized as a Reference Only: 
Chevrolet Express 3500, Ford E-350 Super Duty, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2011 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.15.10.1 Optional Diesel Engine, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2012 Chevrolet CG334052012 Ford Econoline 2012 Ford E-2502012 Ford E-250
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3.15.10.2 Optional Rear passenger side hinged doors, with swing-out glass, 
per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.15 (2012) Passenger Van, 1-Ton, Fifteen (15)-Person Seating Capacity, 
Rear Wheel Drive, Extended Van, 3-Door.  Utilized as a Reference Only: 
Chevrolet Express 3500, Ford E-350 Super Duty, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 EA 1 24,640.00 24,640.00 24,685.00 24,685.00 25,200.00 25,200.00 25,200.00 27,403.00
3.15.10.1 (2012) Optional Diesel Engine, per Specifications.  Model year 
2012 N/A N/A No Bid 11,000.00
3.15.10.2 (2012) Optional Rear passenger side hinged doors, with swing-out 
glass, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 Standard N/A N/C -100.00

Vehicle Make & Model Bid
Item #12 3.16 Cargo Van, 1-Ton, Rear Wheel Drive, Utilized as a Reference 
Only: Chevrolet Express 3500, Ford E-350 Super Duty, per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.16.10.1 Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe light with 
mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.16.10.2 Optional swing out hinged type side with no glass, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.16.10.3 Optional extended van body (231" overall length or better), per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.16.10.4 Class 5 hitch, tow package with 7-pin plug and wiring harness, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.16.10.5 Optional heavy duty amperage alternator, per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.16.10.6 Optional rear heat and A/C, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.16 (2012) Cargo Van, 1-Ton, Rear Wheel Drive, Utilized as a Reference 
Only: Chevrolet Express 3500, Ford E-350 Super Duty, per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 EA 1 21,729.00 21,729.00 20,420.00 20,420.00 21,500.00 21,500.00 22,339.00 22,339.00
3.16.10.1 (2012) Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe light 
with mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 350.00 595.00 259.00 259.00
3.16.10.2 (2012) Optional swing out hinged type side with no glass, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 -100.00 N/C included -100.00

2012 Chevrolet Express Pass Van CG337062012 Ford Econoline 2012 Ford E-3502012 Ford E-350 Club Wagon



Total No. of Bidders:           
Anne Arundel County, Maryland

Tabulation of Bids:  6
IFB NO.: 12-005

TITLE: CARS, VANS, AND LIGHT TRUCKS
OPENING DATE: JANUARY 24, 2012
BID BOND REQUIREMENT: NO
BUYER:   STEPHEN PORTS

Brief Description
Unit 
Price QTY Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price
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3.16.10.3 (2012) Optional extended van body (231" overall length or better), 
per Specifications.  Model year 2012 795.00 21,326.00 800.00 1,500.00
3.16.10.4 (2012) Class 5 hitch, tow package with 7-pin plug and wiring 
harness, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 237.00 369.00 237.00 250.00
3.16.10.5 (2012) Optional heavy duty amperage alternator, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 66.00 standard 42.00 70.00
3.16.10.6 (2012) Optional rear heat and A/C, per Specifications.  Model year 
2012 685.00 898.00 685.00 750.00

Vehicle Make & Model Bid 2012 Chevrolet CG334052012 Ford E-350 Van 2012 Ford E-3502012 Ford Econoline
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Item #1: 3.5 Mid-Size Automobile, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.5.9 Optional Hybrid Power Train, per Specifications (cost to be the total 
price of 3.5 vehicle with the Hybrid power train).  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.5 (2012) Mid-Size Automobile, per Specificiations.  Model year 2012 EA 1 21,897.92 21,897.92 18,012.00 18,012.00

3.5.9 (2012) Optional Hybrid Power Train, per Specifications (cost to be the 
total price of 3.5 vehicle with the Hybrid power train).  Model year 2012 No Bid N/A

Vehicle Make & Model Bid
Item #2: 3.6 Mid-Size Police Package Automobile, per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 EA 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.6.10.1 Optional console mount platform, per Specifications.  Model year 
2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.6.10.2 Optional hole in center of roof, with wiring harness, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.6.10.3 Optional left-hand spot-lamp, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.6.10.4 Optional two-tone paint, per Specifiations.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.6 (2012) Mid-Size Police Package Automobile, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 EA 3 22,022.25 66,066.75 No Bid No Bid
3.6.10.1 (2012) Optional console mount platform, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 125.00 No Bid No Bid
3.6.10.2 (2012) Optional hole in center of roof, with wiring harness, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 127.50 No Bid No Bid
3.6.10.3 (2012) Optional left-hand spot-lamp, per Specifications.  Model year
2012 242.25 No Bid No Bid

3.6.10.4 (2012)Optional two-tone paint, per Specifiations.  Model year 2012 1,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Vehicle Make & Model Bid No Bid No Bid

Item #3: 3.7 Full size police interceptor package, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2011 EA 9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.1 Optional two-tone exterior paint, per Specifications.  Model year 
2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.2 Optional street appearance pacakage, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.7.10.3 Optional cloth bench seats, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2012 Dodge Avenger SE JSDH412012 Chevrolet Malibu

2012 Chevrolet Impala 9C3

TJH Chevrolet Co LLC Carman Dodge Inc.
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3.7.10.4 Optional base police package, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.5 Optional flashing rear deck LED lights, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.6 Optional hole in center of roof with wiring harness, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.7.10.7 Optional left-hand spot-lamp, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.8 Optional cruise control, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.9 Optional white/red incadescent LED dome light, per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.10 Optional complete marked automobile, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.11 Optional complete un-marked automobile, per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7.10.12 Optional complete "turn-key" marked automobile, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7 (2012) Full size police interceptor package, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 EA 9 25,715.02 231,435.18 21,864.00 196,776.00
3.7.10.1 (2012) Optional two-tone exterior paint, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 1,100.00 1,500.00
3.7.10.2 (2012) Optional street appearance pacakage, per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 0.00 425.00
3.7.10.3 (2012) Optional cloth bench seats, per Specifications.  Model year 
2012 N/A N/A
3.7.10.4 (2012) Optional base police package, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 800.00 730.00
3.7.10.5 (2012) Optional flashing rear deck LED lights, per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 300.00 290.00
3.7.10.6 (2012) Optional hole in center of roof with wiring harness, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 125.00 106.00
3.7.10.7 (2012) Optional left-hand spot-lamp, per Specifications.  Model year
2012 391.00 178.00

3.7.10.8 (2012) Optional cruise control, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 0.00 standard
3.7.10.9 (2012) Optional white/red incadescent LED dome light, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 165.75 standard
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TJH Chevrolet Co LLC Carman Dodge Inc.

3.7.10.10 (2012) Optional complete marked automobile, per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 27,340.02 23,168.00
3.7.10.11 (2012) Optional complete un-marked automobile, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 26,715.02 23,309.00
3.7.10.12 (2012) Optional complete "turn-key" marked automobile, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 29,429.02 26,756.00

Vehicle Make & Model Bid
Item #4 3.8 Mini 4x4, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Door: Utilized as a Reference 
Only: Ford Escape, Ford Escape Hybrid, and Jeep Liberty, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011. EA 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.8.10.1 Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe with mounting 
base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  Model year 
2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.8.10.2 Optional AM/FM Radio, CD player, per Specifications.  Model year 
2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.8.10.3 Optional Cruise Control, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.8.10.4 Optional V-6, Gasoline Engine, per Specifications.  Model year 
2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.8.10.5 Optional Two (2)-Wheel Drive, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.8.11 Optional Hybrid Power Train (cost to be the total price of spec 3.8 
vehicle with the Hybrid power train), per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.8 (2012) Mini 4x4, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Door: Utilized as a Reference 
Only: Ford Escape, Ford Escape Hybrid, and Jeep Liberty, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 EA 2 21,885.27 43,770.54 18,291.00 36,582.00
3.8.10.1 (2012) Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe with 
mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 350.00 360.00
3.8.10.2 (2012) Optional AM/FM Radio, CD player, per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 0.00 standard
3.8.10.3 (2012) Optional Cruise Control, per Specifications.  Model year 
2012 0.00 standard
3.8.10.4 (2012) Optional V-6, Gasoline Engine, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 3,009.15 standard

2012 Dodge Charger Pursuit LDDE482012Chevrolet Caprice
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3.8.10.5 (2012) Optional Two (2)-Wheel Drive, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 -1,610.00 -1,479.00

3.8.11 (2012) Optional Hybrid Power Train (cost to be the total price of spec 
3.8 vehicle with the Hybrid power train), per Specifications.  Model year 2012 N/A N/A

Vehicle Make & Model Bid
Item #5 3.9 Mid-Size 4x4, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Door, Utilized as a 
Reference Only: Ford Explorer, and Chevrolet Trailblazer, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.9.10 Optional V-8, Gasoline Engine (cost of engine upgrade only), per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.9.11 Optional Hybrid Power Train (cost to be the total price of 3.2 vehicle 
with the Hybrid power train), per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.9 (2012) Mid-Size 4x4, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Door, Utilized as a 
Reference Only: Ford Explorer, and Chevrolet Trailblazer, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 EA 1 24,898.75 24,898.75 No Bid No Bid
3.9.10 (2012) Optional V-8, Gasoline Engine (cost of engine upgrade only), 
per Specifications.  Model year 2012 N/A No Bid No Bid

3.9.11 (2012) Optional Hybrid Power Train (cost to be the total price of 3.2 
vehicle with the Hybrid power train), per Specifications.  Model year 2012 N/A No Bid No Bid

Vehicle Make & Model Bid No Bid No Bid
Item #6 3.10 Full-Size 4x4, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Door.  Utilized as a 
Reference Only: Ford Expedition, and Chevrolet Tahoe, per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.10.10.1 Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe with 
mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.10.10.2 Optional deduction for deleting floor console, per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.10.10.3 Optional deduction for deleting 3rd row seating, per Specifications.
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.10.10.4 Optional Class III hitch, tow package, with 7-pin plug & wiring 
harness, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2012 Jeep Liberty2012 Chevrolet Equinox

2012 Chevrolet Traverse
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3.10 (2012) Full-Size 4x4, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Door.  Utilized as a 
Reference Only: Ford Expedition, and Chevrolet Tahoe, per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 EA 1 32,564.08 32,564.08 No Bid No Bid
3.10.10.1 (2012) Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe with 
mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 350.00 No Bid No Bid
3.10.10.2 (2012) Optional deduction for deleting floor console, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 -531.25 No Bid No Bid
3.10.10.3 (2012) Optional deduction for deleting 3rd row seating, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 -340.00 No Bid No Bid
3.10.10.4 (2012) Optional Class III hitch, tow package, with 7-pin plug & 
wiring harness, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 0.00 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle Make & Model Bid No Bid No Bid
Item #7: 3.11 Mini Pickup Truck, 1/2-Ton, 2WD, Extended Cab, with 6-ft. 
Cargo Box: Utilized as a Reference Only: Chevrolet Colorado, Ford Ranger, 
per Specifications.  Model year 2011 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.11.10.1 Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Storbe light with 
mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.11.10.2 Optional Four (4)-Wheel Drive, per Specifciations.  Model year 
2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.11 (2012) Mini Pickup Truck, 1/2-Ton, 2WD, Extended Cab, with 6-ft. 
Cargo Box: Utilized as a Reference Only: Chevrolet Colorado, Ford Ranger, 
per Specifications.  Model year 2012 EA 1 16,488.67 16,488.67 No Bid No Bid
3.11.10.1 (2012) Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Storbe light 
with mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 350.00 No Bid No Bid
3.11.10.2 (2012) Optional Four (4)-Wheel Drive, per Specifciations.  Model 
year 2012 2,869.00 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle Make & Model Bid No Bid No Bid
Item #8 3.12 Pickup Truck, 1/2-Ton, 2WD, Full Size, Standard Cab, with 8-
ft. Bed: Utilized as a Reference Only: Chevrolet Silverado 1500, Ford F150, 
per Specifications.  Model year 2011 EA 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.12.10.1 Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe light with 
mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2012 Chevrolet Tahoe

2012 Chevrolet Colorado
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3.12.10.2 Optional extended cab, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.12.10.3 Optional Four (4)-Wheel Drive, per Specifications.  Model year 
2011. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.12.10.4 Optional Class III hitch, tow package, with 7-pin plug & wiring 
harness, per Specifications.  Model year 2011. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.12.10.5 Optional trialer hitch receiver - 9,900 lb. Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.12.10.6 Optional hydraulic lift gate, 1,200 - 1,500 lbs.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.12.10.7 Optional rear seat (for extended cab option only), per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.12 (2012) Pickup Truck, 1/2-Ton, 2WD, Full Size, Standard Cab, with 8-ft. 
Bed: Utilized as a Reference Only: Chevrolet Silverado 1500, Ford F150, 
per Specifications.  Model year 2012 EA 2 16,437.92 32,875.84 No Bid No Bid
3.12.10.1 (2012) Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe light 
with mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 350.00 No Bid No Bid
3.12.10.2 (2012) Optional extended cab, per Specifications.  Model year 
2012 3,705.54 No Bid No Bid
3.12.10.3 (2012)  Optional Four (4)-Wheel Drive, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012. 2,615.50 No Bid No Bid
3.12.10.4 (2012) Optional Class III hitch, tow package, with 7-pin plug & 
wiring harness, per Specifications.  Model year 2012. 1,202.75 No Bid No Bid

3.12.10.5 (2012) Optional trialer hitch receiver - 9,900 lb. Model year 2012 1,950.75 No Bid No Bid
3.12.10.6 (2012) Optional hydraulic lift gate, 1,200 - 1,500 lbs.  Model year 
2012 2,340.00 No Bid No Bid
3.12.10.7 (2012) Optional rear seat (for extended cab option only), per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 0.00 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle Make & Model Bid No Bid No Bid
Item #9 3.13 pickup Truck, 3/4 Ton, 2WD, Full Size, Standard Cab, 8-ft. 
Bed.  Utilized as a Reference Only: Ford F250 SD, and Chevrolet Silverado 
2500 HD, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.13.10.1 Optional Warn Target Tech, Model 901, Amber Strobe Light, with 
in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2012 Chevrolet Silverado
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3.13.10.2 Optional Hydraulic lift gate, 1,200 to 1,500 lbs, per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.13.10.3 Optional Four (4)-Wheel Drive, with automatic locking hubs, and 
shift on the fly Transfer case, per Specifciations.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.13.10.4 Otional Power angle snowplow with lights, deflector, and 
removable light frame and power unit (standard width for 4x4 configuration), 
per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.13.10.5 Optional Towing Command System, with integrated Tow 
Command Trailer Brake Controller, per Specifications. Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.13.10.6 Optional Off Road Package - fel tank and transfer case skid 
plates, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.13.10.7 Optional Complete Pickup Truck, 1-Ton, Full Size, Standard Cab, 
8-ft. Bed, with the following options, 4-Wheel Drive, Towing command 
System with integrated Tow Command Trailer Brake Contoller, Class 4 tow 
package, with trailer wiring 7-/4 pin connector, 9,000-lb Trailer Hitch 
Receiver or greater, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.13 (2012)  pickup Truck, 3/4 Ton, 2WD, Full Size, Standard Cab, 8-ft. Bed. 
Utilized as a Reference Only: Ford F250 SD, and Chevrolet Silverado 2500 
HD, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 EA 1 18,340.48 18,340.48 No Bid No Bid
3.13.10.1 (2012) Optional Warn Target Tech, Model 901, Amber Strobe 
Light, with in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 350.00 No Bid No Bid
3.13.10.2 (2012) Optional Hydraulic lift gate, 1,200 to 1,500 lbs, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 2,340.00 No Bid No Bid
3.13.10.3 (2012) Optional Four (4)-Wheel Drive, with automatic locking 
hubs, and shift on the fly Transfer case, per Specifciations.  Model year 
2012 4,972.26 No Bid No Bid
3.13.10.4 (2012) Otional Power angle snowplow with lights, deflector, and 
removable light frame and power unit (standard width for 4x4 configuration), 
per Specifications.  Model year 2012 4,075.00 No Bid No Bid

3.13.10.5 (2012) Optional Towing Command System, with integrated Tow 
Command Trailer Brake Controller, per Specifications. Model year 2012 412.25 No Bid No Bid
3.13.10.6 (2012) Optional Off Road Package - fel tank and transfer case 
skid plates, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 127.50 No Bid No Bid
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3.13.10.7 (2012) Optional Complete Pickup Truck, 1-Ton, Full Size, 
Standard Cab, 8-ft. Bed, with the following options, 4-Wheel Drive, Towing 
command System with integrated Tow Command Trailer Brake Contoller, 
Class 4 tow package, with trailer wiring 7-/4 pin connector, 9,000-lb Trailer 
Hitch Receiver or greater, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 23,770.39 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle Make & Model Bid No Bid No Bid
Item #10 3.14 Cargo Van, 3/4 Ton, Rear Wheel Drive.  Utilized as a 
Reference Only: Chevrolet Express Cargo 2500, Ford Super Duty E 250, 
per Specifications.  Model year 2011 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.1 Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe light with 
mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.2 Optional Swing out hinged type side door with pop out glass, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.3 Optional Extended van body, (231" in overall length or greater), 
per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.14.10.4 Optional AM/FM CD Player, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.5 Optional Class III Hitch, Tow Package, with 7-pin Plug and wiring 
harness, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.14.10.6 Optional Deduction for Removing the Approved Safety Bulkheads 
behind the drive and passenger seats, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.7 Optional Heavy Duty High Amperage Alternator, per Specifiations. 
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.8 Optional right sliding cargo door with No Glass Window, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.9 Optional rear side hinged panel cargo doors with No Glass Windo, 
per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.10 Optional Deduction for removing interior paneling or molding in 
the vans cargo area to facilitate shelving.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.14.10.11 Optional rear heat and A/C, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.12 Optional side and rear door glass, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2012 Chevrolet Silverado
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3.14 (2012) Cargo Van, 3/4 Ton, Rear Wheel Drive.  Utilized as a Reference 
Only: Chevrolet Express Cargo 2500, Ford Super Duty E 250, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 EA 1 20,544.68 20,544.68 No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.1 (2012) Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe light 
with mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 350.00 No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.2 (2012) Optional Swing out hinged type side door with pop out 
glass, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 -127.50 No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.3 (2012) Optional Extended van body, (231" in overall length or 
greater), per Specifications.  Model year 2012 796.49 No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.4 (2012) Optional AM/FM CD Player, per Specifications.  Model year
2012 174.25 No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.5 (2012) Optional Class III Hitch, Tow Package, with 7-pin Plug and 
wiring harness, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 225.25 No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.6 (2012) Optional Deduction for Removing the Approved Safety 
Bulkheads behind the drive and passenger seats, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 -415.65 No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.7 (2012) Optional Heavy Duty High Amperage Alternator, per 
Specifiations.  Model year 2012 63.75 No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.8 (2012) Optional right sliding cargo door with No Glass Window, 
per Specifications.  Model year 2012 -127.50 No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.9 (2012) Optional rear side hinged panel cargo doors with No Glass 
Windo, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 -255.00 No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.10 (2012) Optional Deduction for removing interior paneling or 
molding in the vans cargo area to facilitate shelving.  Model year 2012 0.00 No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.11 (2012) Optional rear heat and A/C, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 731.00 No Bid No Bid
3.14.10.12 (2012) Optional side and rear door glass, per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 -263.50 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle Make & Model Bid No Bid No Bid
Item #11 3.15 Passenger Van, 1-Ton, Fifteen (15)-Person Seating Capacity, 
Rear Wheel Drive, Extended Van, 3-Door.  Utilized as a Reference Only: 
Chevrolet Express 3500, Ford E-350 Super Duty, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2011 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.15.10.1 Optional Diesel Engine, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2012 Chevrolet Express
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3.15.10.2 Optional Rear passenger side hinged doors, with swing-out glass, 
per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.15 (2012) Passenger Van, 1-Ton, Fifteen (15)-Person Seating Capacity, 
Rear Wheel Drive, Extended Van, 3-Door.  Utilized as a Reference Only: 
Chevrolet Express 3500, Ford E-350 Super Duty, per Specifications.  Model 
year 2012 EA 1 25,794.73 25,794.73 No Bid No Bid
3.15.10.1 (2012) Optional Diesel Engine, per Specifications.  Model year 
2012 10,800.25 No Bid No Bid
3.15.10.2 (2012) Optional Rear passenger side hinged doors, with swing-out 
glass, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 -127.50 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle Make & Model Bid No Bid No Bid
Item #12 3.16 Cargo Van, 1-Ton, Rear Wheel Drive, Utilized as a Reference 
Only: Chevrolet Express 3500, Ford E-350 Super Duty, per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.16.10.1 Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe light with 
mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.16.10.2 Optional swing out hinged type side with no glass, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.16.10.3 Optional extended van body (231" overall length or better), per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.16.10.4 Class 5 hitch, tow package with 7-pin plug and wiring harness, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.16.10.5 Optional heavy duty amperage alternator, per Specifications.  
Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.16.10.6 Optional rear heat and A/C, per Specifications.  Model year 2011 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.16 (2012) Cargo Van, 1-Ton, Rear Wheel Drive, Utilized as a Reference 
Only: Chevrolet Express 3500, Ford E-350 Super Duty, per Specifications.  
Model year 2012 EA 1 20,684.96 20,684.94 No Bid No Bid
3.16.10.1 (2012) Optional Warn Target Tech Model 901 Amber Strobe light 
with mounting base and in-cab switch (NO EXCEPTIONS), per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 350.00 No Bid No Bid
3.16.10.2 (2012) Optional swing out hinged type side with no glass, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 0.00 No Bid No Bid

2012 Chevrolet Express
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3.16.10.3 (2012) Optional extended van body (231" overall length or better), 
per Specifications.  Model year 2012 796.49 No Bid No Bid
3.16.10.4 (2012) Class 5 hitch, tow package with 7-pin plug and wiring 
harness, per Specifications.  Model year 2012 225.25 No Bid No Bid
3.16.10.5 (2012) Optional heavy duty amperage alternator, per 
Specifications.  Model year 2012 63.75 No Bid No Bid
3.16.10.6 (2012) Optional rear heat and A/C, per Specifications.  Model year 
2012 731.00 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle Make & Model Bid No Bid No Bid2012 Chevrolet Express


