
Total No. of Bidders:___4___
Anne Arundel County, Maryland

Tabulation of Bids:
Carmeuse Greer Industries LCI Ltd Key Chemical

IFB NO.: 08-047 Natural Inc d/b/a Inc
TITLE: Chemicals, Water Utility: Hydrofluorosilicic Chemicals Greer Lime Co
OPENING DATE: 07/15/2008
BID BOND REQUIREMENT: NO
BUYER: Brennita Swan / cas-r

Brief Description UOM Quantity Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price

1. Hydrofluorosilicic Acid, cost of bulk Dry Ton 1,240 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 2,347.83 2,911,309.20 835.00 1,035,400.00

2. Hydrofluorosilicic Acid, delivery charge Dry Ton 10 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 50.00 500.00 0.00

3. Hydrofluorosilicic Acid, extra stop charge Dry Ton 20 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 50.00 1,000.00 200.00 4,000.00

Sub Total Bid Lines (1 - 3) 0.00 0.00 2,912,809.20 1,035,400.00

4. Lime, Hydrated, Bulk, cost of bulk Ton 675 161.01 108,681.75 150.00 101,250.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00

5. Lime, Hydrated, Bag cost of bagged Bag 5,600 No Bid 0.00 6.00 33,600.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00

Grand Total All Bid Lines (1 - 5) 108,681.75 134,850.00 2,912,809.20 1,035,400.00
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